
SHRISHTI SRIVASTAVA <shrishti400@gmail.com>

Payment update for your airtel prepaid mobile 9818686997
airtel.payments@in.airtel.com <airtel.payments@in.airtel.com> Fri, Feb 12, 2016 at 2:35 PM
To: shrishti400@gmail.com

Namaste!
Online recharge transaction has been processed successfully for your airtel prepaid mobile 9818686997.
Transaction ID - 492815
Amount (Rs.) - 250.0
Best Regards,
Team Airtel
Please do not reply to this message. Replies to this message are routed to an unmonitored mailbox.
For further assistance, call 121 for general queries(agent assistance is chargeable at 50p/3 min), call 198 for
complaints
This e-mail and any files transmitted with it are for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
confidential and privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail
and destroy all copies and the original message. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure,dissemination, forwarding,
printing or copying of this email or any action taken in reliance on this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
The recipient acknowledges that Bharti Airtel Limited or its subsidiaries and associated companies(collectively "Bharti
Airtel Limited"),are unable to exercise control or ensure or guarantee the integrity of/overthe contents of the
information contained in e-mail transmissions and further acknowledges that any views expressed in this message are
those of the individual sender and no binding nature of the message shall be implied or assumed unless the sender
does so expressly with due authority of Bharti Airtel Limited. Before opening any attachments please check them for
viruses and defects.

Gmail - Payment update for your airtel prepaid mobile 9818686997 https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=fc3caa9bb9&view=pt&q=airt...

1 of 1 21-04-2016 16:15


